

Bull Details							
Lot #	Buyer	Price	Brand	Brand ID #	Birth year	Colour	Horn
1	Mungoorbada	1500	BA	94	9	grey gyr	dehorn
2	No bid		BA	122	9	grey gyr	Dehorn
3	West Elsey	1800	BA	46	9	Grey	Poll
4	No bid		BA		9	Grey	Dehorn
5	West Elsey	1500	BA		9	Grey	Dehorn
6	West Elsey	1500	BA	75	9	grey	Dehorn
7	West Elsey	1500	BA		9	grey	Dehorn
8	Mungoorbada	1800	BA	99	9	grey gyr	dehorn
9	Mungoorbada	1800	BA	104	9	grey	Dehorn
10	No bid		BA	79	9	grey	Dehorn
11	No bid		BA	26	9	grey	Dehorn
12	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		9	grey	Dehorn
13	B & S Gill	2600	BA	19	9	grey	Poll
14	West Elsey	1500	BA		9	white	Poll
15	West Elsey	1500	BA	447	0	white	Dehorn
16	Mungoorbada	1500	BA	53	0	grey	dehorn
17	No bid		BA		9	grey	dehorn
18	No bid		BA	49	0	grey	dehorn
19	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		9	white	Horn
20	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		9	grey	Horn
21	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		9	grey	Horn
22	Sturt Downs	1500	BA		9	Light Red	Dehorn
23	Mungoorbada	1600	BA	81	9	Light Red	Dehorn
24	Mungoorbada	1600	BA		9	Light Red	dehorn
25	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		9	Light Red	Horn
26	West Elsey	1500	BA	140	9	Light red	Dehorn
27	Mungoorbada	1500	BA	74	9	Light Red	dehorn
28	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		9	red	Dehorn
29	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		9	Red	Dehorn
30	No bid		BA	11	9	Red	dehorn
31	No bid		BA		0	red	dehorn
32	Mungoorbada	1500	BA	59	0	red	Dehorn
33	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		0	red	Dehorn
34	Sturt Downs	1500	BA	50	0	Red	dehorn
35	No bid		BA		0	Red	dehorn
36	No bid		BA	34	0	red	dehorn
37	No bid		BA	120	0	Red	Dehorn

Female Details						
Pen	Buyer	Price	Colour	Ptest	Weight	av.kg
1	Sturt Downs	570	Grey DH	2	459.38	421.53
		570	Cream DH	6	443.93	
		570	Grey DH	4	379.04	
		570	Grey DH	3	403.76	
		570	grey H	1	421.53	
2	Mungoorbada	650	Grey H	3	338.87	348.58
		650	Grey DH	3	333.72	
		650	Grey DH	1	380.07	
		650	Grey DH	4	353.29	
		650	Ginger DH	2	364.62	
		650	Grey DH	5	346.08	
		650	Grey DH	3	323.42	
3	Mungoorbada	680	GreyBri DH	4	320.33	304.73
		680	Grey DH	3	309	
		680	Grey DH	4	310.03	
		680	Grey Poll	4	305.91	
		680	Ginger DH	2	316.21	
		680	Grey DH	4	287.37	
		680	Ggyr Poll	7	284.28	
4	Mungoorbada	650	Red DH	5	360.5	383.16
		650	Dunn DH	5	358.44	
		650	Red DH	3	386.25	
		650	Red DH	5	413.03	
		650	Red DH	3	397.58	
5	Mungoorbada	600	LightRed DH	5	432.6	399.43
		600	Red DH	7	389.34	
		600	Red DH	6	371.83	
		600	LightRed DH	4	415.09	
		600	Red DH	2	388.31	
6	Mungoorbada	700	Red DH	5	393.46	362.05
		700	Red DH	5	360.5	
		700	Red DH	4	346.08	
		700	Red DH	5	350.2	
		700	Red DH	6	331.66	
		700	Red DH	5	390.37	
7	Mike Early	660	LightRed DH	4	331.66	286.05
		660	Red Scur	3	294.58	



38	Mungoorbada	1800	BA		0	Red Gyr	Horn
39	Sturt Downs	1500	BA	414	0	red	dehorn
40	No bid		BA	62	0	grey	dehorn
41	No bid		BA		0	grey	Dehorn
42	Bill Darcy	2700	BA	73	9	grey	Poll
43	No bid		BA		9	grey	dehorn
44	No bid		BA	91	9	Grey	Dehorn
45	No bid		BA	78	9	Grey	dehorn
46	No bid		BA	60	0	Grey	Dehorn
47	No bid		BA	455	0	grey	dehorn
48	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		0	grey	Horn
49	No bid		BA		0	grey	dehorn
50	No bid		BA	372	0	grey	dehorn
51	No bid		BA	415	0	grey	dehorn
52	Bill Darcy	2000	BA	340	0	Grey	poll
53	Bill Darcy	2000	BA	418	0	Grey	Poll
54	Bill Darcy	2000	BA	343	0	grey	Poll
55	Bill Darcy	1800	BA	429	0	grey	poll
56	Sturt Downs	1500	BA	445	0	grey	poll
57	Bill Darcy	1800	BA	352	0	Grey	scur
58	No bid		BA		0	grey	dehorn
59	No bid		BA	402	0	grey	dehorn
60	No bid		BA	428	0	grey	dehorn
61	Sturt Downs	1500	BA	110	0	Light Red	dehorn
62	West Elsey	1500	BA		0	Light red	dehorn
63	Mungoorbada	1700	BA	420	0	light red	dehorn
64	West Elsey	1500	BA		0	Light Red	dehorn
65	West Elsey	1500	BA		0	Light Red	scur
66	Mungoorbada	2100	BA	390	0	Light Red	dehorn
67	West Elsey	1500	BA	382	0	Light Red	dehorn
68	West Elsey	1500	BA		0	Light Red	Dehorn
69	Mungoorbada	1700	BA	52	0	Light Red	dehorn
70	Mungoorbada	1500	BA		0	light red	dehorn
71	Mungoorbada	1700	BA	61	0	Red	Dehorn
72	Mungoorbada	1700	BA	130	0	Light Red	Dehorn
73	No bid		BA		0	Red	dehorn
74	B & S Gill	1500	BA		0	red	dehorn
75	No bid		BA		0	red	Dehorn

\$ 1,646.94 49 sold
 \$ 80,700.00 2700 top price

		660	Red DH	4	296.64	
		660	Dk Red DH	2	273.98	
		660	Red DH	2	260.59	
		660	Red DH	4	291.49	
		660	LightRed H	3	253.38	
8	Mungoorbada	400	Grey H	0	309	291.9
		450	Ginger DH	0	265.74	
		450	Grey DH	0	289.43	
		450	Ginger DH	0	278.1	
		450	Ginger DH	0	317.24	
9	Mungoorbada	450	Grey DH	1	262.65	260.25
		450	Grey DH	0	285.31	
		450	Grey DH	0	260.59	
		450	Grey H	0	248.23	
		450	Grey DH	0	257.5	
		450	Grey DH	0	247.2	
10	Mungoorbada	450	LightRed DH	0	265.74	253.79
		450	LightRed DH	0	225.57	
		450	LightRed DH	0	252.35	
		450	LightRed DH	0	261.62	
		450	LightRed DH	0	263.68	
11	Mungoorbada	450	Red DH	0	279.13	255.85
		450	Red H	0	260.59	
		450	Red Gyr DH	0	243.08	
		450	Red DH	0	285.31	
		450	Red DH	0	211.15	
12	Mungoorbada	660	Red DH	0	289.43	294.07
		660	Red DH	0	294.58	
		660	Red DH	0	285.31	
		660	Red H	0	305.91	
		660	LightRed DH	0	315.18	
		660	LightRed DH			
		660	LightRed DH	0	273.98	

\$ 589
 \$ 41,250
 70
 700

